
To: Jeffrey Epsteinijeevacationagmail.comj 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent Tue 9/15/2009 2:47:57 PM 
Subject RE: 

I will call now.. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fax 

cel 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeeyacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, September 15, 2009 10:48 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

tell him that got the money.. there is no question, we have a note that we can enforce 
with fees attached„ it will be easy, he should start legal prceddings inunediatley, and recognize 
that she will have to declare 60 k of income. at a minimum 

On Tue, Sep 15, 2009 at 10:42 AM, Rich Kahn > wrote: 

I finally connected wita after leaving numerous messages. I told her that she should pay 
30k and you would forgive 30k. She got all flustered and put her husband on the 
phone. He sternly stated he wants JEE to write a letter that owes him nothing and if that 
is not received this week then they will take this to legal proceedings. Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
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PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

tel 

fa 

cel 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationegmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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