
To: Jeevacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Tue 10/27/2009 1:19:00 PM 
Subject: RE: col's 

Please confirm that yes was to outstanding balance of $160,741.17. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 

From: Jeevacation [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, October 27, 2009 7:33 AM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Cc: Rich Kahn; Darren Indyke (AOL) 
Subject: Re: col's 

Yes to pay gensler. Sorry I want to be intimately involved 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 26, 2009, at 7:36 PM, "Gary Kerney" wrote: 

No. l"Il find out. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 26, 2009, at 5:49 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein" <jcevacationggmail.com> wrote: 

do you know how much we pay a kilowatt hour 
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On Mon, Oct 26, 2009 at 5:44 PM, Gary Kerney 
wrote: 

I will mock them up and also get some Photoshop from patio views 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 26, 2009, at 5:40 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation(agmail.com> wrote: 

my sense is that the two ten inch work best' 

On Mon, Oct 26, 2009 at 4:28 PM, Gary Kerney 
ifi liavrolc: 

Jeffrey 

after looking at all the column sizes I understand your 
concern trying to be complementary to the office. my 
observation is concerning the scale of the col's from the 
patios on the master as well as the main house in the future. 
the round col's are 10" and square is more mass, standing on 
the patio my sense is 14" square is getting big. I will shoot 
some photo's from the patio tomorrow and forward for some 
more Photoshop work if you approve? 

Gary 

***************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacatioragmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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