
To: Emad Hann 
Cc: Darren Indyke 
From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Thur 7/9/2009 6:57:44 PM 
Subject: Re: Nash payment #10 

eeyacation@gmail.compeeyacation@gmail.coml 

Gary K indicated that he has no interest in approving requistions OR budgets So 
dear say it falls back on doug and I until someone says differently 

 Original Message 
From: Emad Hanna  
To: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Thu Jul 09 14:48:24 2009 
Subject: RE: Nash payment #10 

Brice, 

Does this mean you now have your approval status as it was? 

Do I need to inform JE of outgoing payments? 

Thanks 

 Original Message 
From: Brice Gordon 
Sent: Thursday, July 09, 2009 2:41 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Nash payment 110 

Req approved 
Amount $24,806-21 
Please pay 
Doug and I have reviewed work 
Brice 
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