To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)
From: David Stern

Sent: Tue 7/28/2009 11:11:50 AM

Subject: Re: Re:

far from complete!

complete mess, thats why deep dive into financial and IP situation is needed before any
deal/investment is made.

On 28 Jul 2009, at 12:01, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

she shows no loan to david roland for ex_. this does not scem complete.

On Tue, Jul 28, 2009 at 7:00 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

her balance sheet has to be filled in with terms and conditions on both
sides,, payment for work and terms of loans . she is a woman with no sense of this
whatsoevr, she said she has a loan against jewelery,, for ex what jewelry?

On Tue, Jul 28, 2009 at 6:50 AM, David Stern _-“-" wrote:

Will be in NYC tomorrow and F. wants to meet there, so will call vou briefly
today to get your view following yesterday’s lunch.
Hope you sleep a lot !
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