To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Mon 8/3/2008 7:47:06 PM

Subject: RE:

| called on Friday and again today regarding a discount on the French Culinary Institute. | told them | am
not sure if we will be able to enroll without a discount and they did not budge on the total amount due
of 42,000, Please advise.

Rich Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, July 31, 2009 1:05 PM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re:

call the school and 1 belvie there was a discount.. try |, no downside thell them otherwise you are
not sure,

On Fri. Jul 31, 2009 at 1:02 PM. Rich Kahn _ wrote:

[ just rcccix-cd-cducmion bill and it came in at 42,000 (sec attached) as compared to the
40,000 we spoke about. s this ok to pay from your personal account?

Rich Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.
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