To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail. com)]
From: Emad Hanna

Sent: Tue 8/4/2008 1:38:06 PM

Subject: FW: LSJ Landscaping Architect

Jeffrey,

¥ou asked me to remind you about this on Tuesday.

Just so you know I'm out the rest of the week on vacation but reachable if you need me for anything

Thanks

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates

From: Emad Hanna
Sent: Friday, July 31, 2009 3:54 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: LS) Landscaping Architect

leffrey,

| received a payment request for landscape design fees in the amount of $ 5,545 signed off by Stephen
Caplinger & Gary Kerney,
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Do | have your approval to process this payment?

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates
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