
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Rich Kahn 
Sent: Wed 4/22/2009 7:23:02 PM 
Subject: RE: Harry Salary 

I asked Darren, Curtis, Silvania & Brice and no one seems to have a copy of this invoice. 

Do you have copy? 

Should I contact Hasan or just send 10k to him? 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2009 12:21 PM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Harry Salary 

yes,,, also plesc py hasan kahn bill for 10k 

On Wed, Apr 22, 2009 at 12:14 PM, Rich Kahn •= 1- wrote: 

I understand from Darren that we will be splitting Harry's salary between HBRK & DKI. 

Would you like split to be 50 / 50? 

Please advise. 
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Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

PO Box 400 

New York, NY 10150 
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