
To: JEEljeevacat" 
Cc: Brice Gordon 
From: curtis R 
Sent: Tue 4/21/2009 11:01:36 AM 
Subject: Re: Mechanical budget revised 
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Title: Re: Mechanical budget revised 46.72% paid to date 
Please find attached revised Original approved budget — same as I sent you last Friday — with Paid to 
date as per yesterday and including Newman & Moll which you approved and will be posted today. 
Note : we are still carrying $709,500 in their Budget line item rather than their buy out number of 
689,000.00 because there will be extra work needed to terminate the existing building if we do not 

proceed with the next phase, whichwe will present to you later this week, as I mentioned below. 
Please review this existing budget presented for your approval 

Curtis 

Original approved budget: $2,330,543.72 
Revised budget: $2,012,685.05 

PAID to DATE: $940,413.62 

On 4/17/09 4:33 PM, "JEE" <jeevacation@email.com> wrote 

what has been paid to date? 

On Fri, Apr 17, 2009 at 3:42 PM, curtis wrote: 

We are currently working on scope and budget for the steel alternate 

building as per your request. We have the Engineer coming on Tuesday to 
review the condition of the hill. 

We will have a new budget for the generator and RO build out next week which should 
satisfy future demand and leave room for integration of steel or other 
options. 

Jeffrey, 
Please approve the revised previously approved budget on the 

Mechanical building. 
This is the existing budget reworked to more accurately represent the 

work done and completion of scope -Same as we did for 
the Office Pavilion. 

Original approved budget: $2,330,543.72 
Revised budget: $2,012,685.05 
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PAID to DATE: 

I will report to you for approvals on Trade line items — ONLY if 

they 
go over Budget. 

Emad will monitor Budget as firewall against budget breach. 

I DO NOT anticipate any changes except downward in price. 
Curtis-
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