To: iglisey acation@gmail. com]
From:

Sent: Mon 5472009 3.58:09 PM

Subject: Re: Re:

2 years. If going full time. So, 2. (60 credits)

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Date: Mon, 04 May 2009 11:44:25 -0400
To:
Subject: Re: Re:

one year only? or how many?

On Mon, May 4, 2009 at 11:36 :\T'-.-'L_ wrote:

the whole program.

On Monday, May 04, 2009, at 11:32AM, "Jeffrey Epstein” <jeevacation{@ gmail.com™> wrote:
=is that for one year or for the whole pro=gram..

>> 50 nice to hear back from you!!!

== she went to the pacific college of oriental medicine. 1 just got off the

== phone with them and classes start today but they said it shouldn't be a

== problem since I had submitted an application for a previous semester. after
== | register for my classes they would give me an invoice for the semester and
== the entire certification course 1s just under $25,000 plus books

== this is their main site and also their page of tuition and fees:

>> www, pacificcollege.edu
==

== http:/'www pacificcollege eduw/prospective/pdfs/ny_tuition_2008 2009 pdf
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== 1f it is possible to help I would be forever ever ever grateful, and if not

>> | completely understand.

== | already have a lot to repay you for and look forward to doing so when you
== get back.
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== On Monday, May 04, 2009, at 08:30AM, "Jeffrey Epstem” <
>> Jeevacation(igma 1= Wrotc:
== =what school did -gu to.. get all the info  glad you are well

>>>0n Sun, May 3, 2009 at 12:26 AM, -_

== ZWrote;

e

e TaTh

>> == | realize this is a horrible time to ask but I don't really have anyone
=>> >> else to turn to. | am looking for a way to get my massage license and
= Was

== == wondering if you could help me afford to go to the new york college or
>> the

== == pacific college of oriental medicine. You had offered in the past and |
== Was

== => wondering if the offer still stands. | am of course more than happy to
== do

> == anything for you in return.

e

== == miss you a lot.
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