
To: m • v in m • omj 
From: 
Sent Fri 5/1/2009 10:43:20 PM 
Subject: Re: Re: 

Sory I haven't answer this morning, I had my bday party yesterday and slept till late! I'll call= 
I'd like to work for a couple of days, though I don't know if I'm that good on answering phones... 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeevacation 
Date: .1  31.1Ai•Nfr 9 07:43:48 -0400
To: 
Subject: Re: Re: 

Give me a phone number to call you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 30, 2009, at 8:40 PM, wrote: 

Why do u say I'm teriffic? I didn't ask him to send u the bill! If you don't feel like 
helping me with this,I'll find a solution! I'll run in Romania :)) :)) :)) 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Thu, 30 Apr 2009 18:06:52 -0400 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

I am confused... did you tell him that you couldn't pay. , before he started the work/? did 
he tell you how much it would cost.. what would you like me to do ? I think you 
are terriffic, why did he send me the bill? you need to find out how mcuh it will 
cost to fix.. romainain are the problem not the cure 

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 5:42 PM, wrote: 

Unfortunatlly at the time being I can't afford to pay him... :( I didn't know it was 
that expensive... 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Thu 30 A r 2009 17:31:52 -0400 
To: 
Subjec : e: 

are you going to pay his bill ?„ how much did he say it would cost to finish to job,,, I don't 
understand. 

On Thu, Apr 30, 2009 at 5:12 PM, wrote: 

It is..I of reall scared of what he told me yesterday... That is a huge mess with 
all my on all of them,and if he doesn't change the surface now,in 3 
years will have to put :( 

Is too expensive here so I'de better have them done in Romania coz is much cheaper! The 
ones he did yesterday were really damaged and it was painfidl for me! 

So I'll cancel my next appointment... 

Sent via BlackBerry from T-Mobile 

From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Date: Thu 30 A .r 2009 12:49:02 -0400 
To: 
Subject: 

is this you„, ?? it is quite a lot of money 
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