To: jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Wed 5/13/2009 2:14:40 PM

Subject: FW: Invoice for PR services for Peggy Siegal Inc.

Title: Invoice for PR services for Peggy Siegal Inc.

Is this 25,000 consulting invoice ok to be paid in addition to 11,000 euro to be paid directly to hospital for
surgery?

Please advise.

From: Deanna Romeo [mailto:

Sent: Wednesday, May 13, 2009 7:27 AM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Invoice for PR services for Peggy Siegal Inc.

Rich,

Jeflrey instructed Peggy 1o send along the attached invoice for $25,000. Can vou please let me know when the
mgney will be wired so that 1 can alert my accounting department.

Many thanks for your help!
Best regards,

Deanna M. Romeo

waggingtail entertainment limited
Peggy Siegal Inc.

900 Broadway. Suite 400

New York, NY 10003

T50 Lexington Avenue, 5th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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