
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeeyacation©gmail.corn] 
From: 
Sent: We • •52 PM 
Subject: RE: 

Ok.. Will do 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Se • Wednesday. May 20, 2009 11:19 AM 
To: 
Subject: Re: 

give her an adddtional 200 

On Wed, May 20, 2009 at 11:13 AM wrote: 

stopped by before her appt this morning...she is asking again about her phone. She said 
she purchased an 1-Phone on her CC and it was $450 and now she has to pay it... 

If I hear nothing, I will assume we are done with this question (and she is to use what she has 
rec'd!) 

****Please note m new email address The old email address will become 
obsolete! Thanks, *** 
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