To: Florida Science Foundation[jeevacation@gmail.com)]
From:

Sent: Wed 6/3/2009 1:34:19 PM

Subject: FW: Gradall LSJ

Title: FW: Gradall LSJ To: JEE

Confirming yesterday’s response, do we have approval to purchase Gradall that was forward to you
by Emad.

Total cost including shipping $40,000.00

Brice

------ Forwarded Message

From: Emad Hanna <
Date: W\=d OO0 0 -8 _BA
To:
Conversation: Lrada
Subject: FW: Gradall LS)

Sent: r r .

To: Emad Hanna
Subject: Fwd: Gradall LS]

Hi Emad
F¥1 - time to do some checking of options

All the best K
----- Original Message-----

Sent: Tue, e 12!
Subject: Re: Gradall LS]

yEes

To: JEE

attached are photo's of 1 of the Two Gradall's (544D) on Island

this machine has a blown engine and repair cost for just the block is estimated at 12k not including
labor

After inspecting this machine, this is not the only repair/ major maintenance required, estimate about
15 to 20K

requesting approval to investigate the replacement this unit.

Please note that there is a definite need to have two units operational on island.

regards Brice
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Great Deals on Dell Laptops. Starting at $499.
<http://pr.atwola.com/promoclk/100000075x1217469328x1201155439/acl ?redir=http://ad.do
ubleclick.net/clk;211531132;33070124;e>

Great Deals on Dell Laptops. Starting at $499.
<http://pr.atwola.com/promoclk/100000075x1217469328x1201155439/acl?redir=http://ad.do
ubleclick.net/clk:211531132:33070124:e>

------ End of Forwarded Message

EFTA_R1_01518550
EFTA02443237



