From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, November 4, 2016 8:16 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: 727

yes

On Fri, Nov 4, 2016 at 9:15 PM, Richard Kahn richard_ wrote:

we a=e able to maintain insurance on fuselage and avianonics for an amount up t= 600,000
insurance cost is 1% (or 6,000 per year) with 10,000 deductible

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

New York, NY 10022

tel 212-971-1306 <tel:212-971-1306>
646-350-0954 <tel:646-350-0954>
917-414-7584 <tel:917-414-7584>

=C2 please note

The informat=on contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only =or the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthoriz=d use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=> , and destroy this
communication and all copies =hereof, including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved </=iv>
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