
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2016 3:04 PM 
To: Joi Ito 
Subject: Re: Sultan's hotel 

Yes all 

On Wednesday, 26 October 2016, Joi Ito <-> wrote: 

Would you include the restaurants, tea=ceremony and all of the costs or just the hotel? 

Sent from my iPhon= 

On Oct 26, 2016, at 10:48, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Just send bill 

On Wednesday, 26 October =016, Joi Ito < <javascript:_e(%78%7D/cvmli/joi@i=o,com1;» 
wrote: 

Hi Jeffrey, 

I just realized that Sultan and his gang left the hotel charges on my credi= card... roughly $10K. I 
assume I should email Sultan and Jim and as= them to cover at that right? He makes me pay my own way at his hotels 
whe= I stay there... 

- Joi 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
TEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 

=AO please note 

The information=contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client=privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for=br>the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized =se, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this co=munication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or b= e-mail to 
jeev=cation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies the=eof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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