From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, October 21, 2016 4:54 PM
To: BMG; Richard Kahn
Subject: Fwd: Cash workers 10/17-21/16

so far peters guys are malingereers

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <= class="gmail_sendername">Richard Kahn -:_:'-::r:-Date: Fri, Oct 21, 2016 at 12:53 PM

Subject: Fwd: Cash workers 10/17-=1/16
To: leffrey Epstein <j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >

thank yo=

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:
From: Ann Rodriquez < - ->>
Subject: <=b>Re: Cash workers 10/17-21/1&

Date: October 21, 2=16 at 12:50:30 PM EDT

-:f:i\.r::-

Cc: Daphne =allace < >

We divided the landscapers into 2 groups LSJ/GS) but Pete= didn't have any and Bossman said to find him a
crew for LS).

Ann R.

EFTA_R1_01542927
EFTA02446398



On Oct 21, 2016, at 12:37 PM, Richard =ahn < >

wrote:

why so many workers and how long will this continue for?
please advi=e

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

New York, NY 10022

on oct 21, 2016, at 11:22 AV, |
<mailto | - > wrote:

Ann R.
Begin forwarded message:

F=om: Ann Rodriquez <[ -

Date: October 20, 2016=at 10:59:00 AM AST

To: Rich Kahn < > >,
Daphne W=llace < -

Subject: Cash workers 10/17-21/16

=div=Hey Rich,
Requesting cash for =ontractors who worked from 10/17-21/16:

L=1/G5) Carpenters:
-Emile 5120.00 a day x 5 days = 5600.=0
-Maho $120.00 a day x 5 days = $600.00

LS) Wreck shop:
-Samuel 5100.00 a day x 5 days = $500.=0

LS) Landscapers:
-Fabi=n $100.00 a day x 5 days = $500.00
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=C24 please note

-Raheem 5100.00 a day=x 5 days = $500.00
-Charles $100.00 a day x 5 days = $=00.00
-Joacene $100.00 a day x 3 days =5300.00
-Delron $100.00 a day x 3 days =5300.00
-George 51=0.00 a day x 3 days =5300.00
-Orel $100.00 a day x 3 day= = $300.00

Chiropractic Services:
Jason 10/13 (JE back) 5100.00

C=rpenters payout: 51,800.00
Wreck shop payout: 5500.00
Landscapers payout: 52,700.00
Chiropractic payo=t: $100.00

Cash workers: $5,100.00=br>0n hand: $000.00

Cash out: 55,100.00
Requesting cash amount: 55,100.00

Ann R.

=span id="m_-4692752333441768128cid:2857179E-E4D1-4A6E-A119-

<=pan>

The information contained in this communication =s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute in=ide information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It =s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thi=
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be=unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please noti=y us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com=> , and

des=roy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved
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