
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2016 9:14 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Pokey: Staff Bath 

yes 

On Mon, Oct 31, 2016 at 9:16 PM, Ann Rodriquez > 
wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Would you like us to give Pokey his final paym=nt for the staff bath? $1,500.00 

Bid =as for: $12,000.00 
Paid to date: $10,500.00 
Owed: $1,5=0.00 

Ann R. 

Begin forwa=ded message: 

From: Ann =odriquez <1 <mailton > 
Date: October 25, 2016 at 4:19:00 P= AST 
To: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Subject: Pokey: =taff Bath 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey has completed the =taff Bath. 
Danny has confirmed that Pokey is 100• complet=d and it's now for him to do the plumbing. 

Bid was for: $12,000.00 
Paid to date: $10,500.00 
Owed: $1,500.00 

Please advise= 
Ann R. 
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=AO please note 

The information contained in this communicati=n is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. =t is the property of JEE Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of =his communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may=be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and =estroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved 
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