From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, October 21, 2016 2:52 PM
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: LS) Qutdoor lights

Ok

On Friday, October 21, 2016, Richard Kann N - ot

please confirm ok=to purchase 50 outdoor lights for LSJ thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

MNew York, NY 10022
tel
fax

cel

Begin forwarded message:

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Daphne Wal=ace

I c5_<(576%70, o > >

Subject:

Date: October 21, 2016 at=10:31:03 AM EDT

To= Rich Kahn cjauaf.cript:_E{%?E%?D,'cuzl'._'}:b >, Brice
Gordon <javascript:_e(%/B%70, =vel', | G ) ;- =. 2nn rodriquez
e:_ <javascript:_e(%7B%7D, cvmI&#=9;, >

Greetings Rich,

Requesting a wire for payment today:

American Export: $6,197.00 (Quote R1610144)

Bri=e verbally approved to me to proceed with ordering the (50) light units an= (50) cover lens.
The revised quote is attached f=r your reference.

---------- Forw=rded message ----------

EFTA_R1_01544158
EFTA02447208



From: Jack Rvan{fﬂ_
<javascript:_e(%78%70, cvm!’, - -
Date: Fri, Oct 21, 2016 at 9:24 AM<=r=5ubject: REVISED Estimate from AMERICAN EXPORT

Dear Daphne,

Please review the attached estimate. Feel free to contact us if you h=ve any questions.
We look forward to working with you.

Sincerely,

Jack Ryan
American Export Company

please note

The=information contained in this communication is confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is inten=ed only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE U=authorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
receive= this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and al= copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed
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