
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, October 17, 2016 3:09 PM 
To: Brad Wechsler; Melanie Spinella 
Subject: Re: 

put torn on the person to contact front page.=C2 

On Mon, Oct 17, 2016 at 10:38 AM, Brad Wechsler <BWe=hsler@elysllc.com <mailto:BWechsler@elyslIc.com» wrote: 

=he taxes are ready to go according to Ftl and Torn. There were two changes m=de last friday: $4mm of RA and 
Artspace losses can/shld reduce the 3.8% me=icare tax and $7mm of TRA payments shld also be exempt from medicare 
taxes=(consistent with prior year APO and Akin Gump advice). In aggregate this i=creases our overpayment by $400k. 

Pls call me and I'll find rich and tom if you want to discuss. Thx, b Otherwise, taxes are complete and we are 
ready to press the button and file=electronically. B 

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

=AO please note 

The information contained i= this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged,=may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use =f the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclos=re or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication =n error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to =a 
href="mailtoieevacation@gmail.com" target="_blank">jeevacation@gmai=.com, and destroy this communication and 
all copies thereof, inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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