From: Lawrence Krauss m

Sent: Thursday, May 3, 2018 2:49 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Invoice from KaiserDillon PLLC - Krauss

Let's talk later.

Lawrence M. Krauss
=b class="" style="background-color: rgba(255, 255, 255, 0);"> Director, The Origins Project at ASU <=b> Foundation
Professor School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physic= Department Arizona State University, P.O. Box 871404, <x-

apple-data-detectors://1/1> Tempe, AZ 85287-1404 <x-apple-data-detectors://=/1> Research Offi
Mnthia}: - <tel:4=0.965.0053>

origins.asu.edu <http://origins. asu.ed=/> | twitter.com/lkraussl <http://twitter.com=lkraussl> |
krauss.faculty.asu.edu</=iv>

i believe you have made it impossible to stay. .=nbsp; again it most likely , though to be time money.&nbs=;
negotiation. diminished by legal fees.

On Thu, May 3, 2018 at 10:23 AM Lawrence=Krauss - cmailm- &g=; wrote:

| underst=nd. Thanks.
Lawrenc= M. Krauss

Sent from my iPhone

On May 3, 2018, at 7:11 AM, jeffrey E. <Arizona State University, =a>P.0, Box 871404, Tempe, AZ 85287-
1404=/span>

assistant essica) [ AR

origins.asu.e=u <http:/forigins.asu.edu/> | <http://twitter.com/Ikraussl> | krauss.faculty.asu.edu
<http://krauss.facult=.asu.edu/>

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:
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From: KaiserDillon Billing
Date= May 3, 2018 at 6:21:07 AM MST
To:
=c: Justin Dillon . Matthew Kaiser

Subject: Invoice from KaiserDillon PLLC - Krauss

De=r Dr. Krauss:

En=sp;

Th=nk you for letting us be of service to you.

Attached is your invoice for legal services through April 30, 2018.</=>
&n=sp;

Yo=r account has a balance of $8,837.50. Please remit payment in the amount of=523,837.50 to pay

your balance and replenish your retainer to the previousl= agreed amount of $15,000.00.

p=yment:

2850= .

En=sp;
If you would like to pay by c=eck, please send a check to our address:

Washington, DC 20005<=p>

If you would like to make an=online payment, please click on the following link to make a secure online

https://fidelipay.com/kaiserlawfirm <https://fide=ipay.com/kaiserlawfirm=

If you have any questions, please feel free to call us at (202) 640-2850<=a> <tel:%28=02%29%20640-

KaiserDillon PLLC

Washington, DC 20005
kaiserdillon.com</=pan> <http://kaiserdillon.com>
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==iv dir="auto">

please note

The=information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be atto=ney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intende= only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unau=horized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part the=eof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received thi=
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mai= or by e-mail to <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= , and
destroy this communication and all copies=thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
</=iv>

<=iv dir="Itr"> please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may b= attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is i=tended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEEUnauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any pa=t thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
receiv=d this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all c=pies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved<=r> =
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