
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 22, 2016 6:33 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Punch List Item #10 - GSJ Waste Bin - September 20, 2016 
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On Thursday, 22 September 2016, Richard Kahn wrot=: 

co=t to ship bins via tropical is approximately 6200 whether we ship 1 or 2 b=ns as 2nd bin goes inside 1st bin 
order below for one 7 gage steel bin=(same as all others on LSJ and GSJ) costs 4,950 (before i negotiate) =/div> 
shall we stick with 1 bin or order 2? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From: Daphne 
Wal=ace 

Subject: 

Date: Septem=er 20, 2016 at 3:56:41 PM EDT 

To: Rich Kahn 
>, Brice Gordon 

per JE: 

ann rodriquez 

Greeti=gs, 

For review and approval to proceed with ordering on= 20 cubic yard tub-style roll-off waste bin for GSJ, 

Wastequip: 
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(1) =0 CY tub style bin (Waste Green): $ 4,400.00 - 7 gage (stronger) 

Freight to Tropical Shippin= FL: 550.00<=div> 
Shipping to SIT: =C24> Q=A0 6,178.00 
Excise 40' flat rack fee: =C240 100.0= 
Bob Lynch clearance fees: Q=A0 =C240 75.00 
US Customs: USA made = FREE 
Transport to LSJ: In house - N/A =C240 40=A0 
4>=A0 =C241 4>=A0 $ 11,303.=0 

IES Sales=and Services LLC: 

(1= 20 CY tub style bin (Waste Mgt Green): $ 2,800.00 10 gage (not as s=rong) 

Freight to Tropic=l Shipping FL: 4>=AO 150.00 
Shipping=to STT: 4>=A0 =C24> 6,178.00 
Excise 408d1=9; flat rack fee: =C24> Q=A0100.00 
Bob Lynch clearance fees: 4>=A0 =C24., 75.00 
US Customs: USA made - FREE 
Tran=port to LSJ: In house - N/A 4>=A0 

=C24> 4r=A0 =C2* $ 9,30=.00 

please note 

confidential, may be=attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is i=tended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE<=r>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any =art thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have rec=ived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
re=urn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication an= all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights r=served 
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