
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

i pay 

On Fri, Sep 23, 2016 at 1:13 PM, 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Friday, September 23, 2016 5:17 PM 

Re: Magnani 

> wrote: 

=he Dr Magnani has just send Bella the bill for=my treatment (the crown that broke - the one he put 5 years ago 
and was su=posed to last for 10 years) is 3200 - I didn't know it would be that h=gh, had an emergency cause it broke 
completely! Shall I pay for it my=elf? 

=/div> 

Forwarded message 
From: bell=klein 
Date: Friday, September 23, 2016 
Subject: Fw=: Magnani 
To: 

=div style="word-wrap:break-word">Svet, 
Please confirm your appointme=t and forward JE approval. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

ar> 

The information contained in this communication is c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside in=ormation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Svetlana Pozhidaev=. 

=C2 please note 
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The informat=on contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only =or the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthoriz=d use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this 
communication and all copies =hereof, including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved </=iv> 
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