
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 8:48 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Invoice 2383 Verglas Studio 

or call me now 

<=r> 

On Tue, Sep 20, 2016 at 4:35 PM, Richard Kahn= 
wrote: 

please advise if ok to pa= 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel a/a> 
fax 646-350-0954 <tel:646-350-0954> 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px">From= 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 2383 Verglas Studio 

September 20, 2016 at 4:34:01 PM EDT 
<=div> 
To: "=a href="mailto target="_blank" 

 Forwarded message 
From: Lera Loeb 
Date: Tuesday, September 20, 2016 
Subject: Invoice 238 erglas Studio 
To: =t; 

EFTA_R1_01549537 
EFTA02450572



Dear 

I'=m attaching the invoice for the 6 portraits. 
Please let me=know if you have any questions or require any additional information.Q=A0 
Thank you 
Best, 
Lera 

=span style="border-collapse:separate;white-space:normal;font-size:24px">=b> 

Kind rega=ds, 
</=iv> 
<1=> 

=font face="Helvetica" size="2">Lera Loeb 
antoineverglas.com 

ANTOINE VERGIAS STUDIO<=font> 

<=> 

=font face="Arial" size="2"> 

130 WEST 3RD ST, STE 4N 
<=div> 
=/div> 

=div style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left=0px;min-
height:11px">NEW Y=RK, NY 10012 

M=BILE 
PHONE 
FAX : 212 334 0135 <tel:212%20334%2=0135> 
EMAIL: <= 
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=C24o please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 
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