
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Friday, September 16, 2016 5:47 PM 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Fwd: billing - AV shooting 

It i-=;5 about Antoine's shooting 
<=pan style="background-color:rgba(255,255,255,0)"> 

Forwarded mess=:e 
From: Lera Loeb 
Date: Friday, September 16,=2016 
Subject: billing - AV shooting 
To: 

Dear M, 

I hope you're great. 
Pl=ase let me know how you'd like me to invoice you for the shooting..=A0 
I have an old invoice from August 2012 for a few portraits by=AV billed to 
do it the same w=y as before? 
Thank you 
Best, 
Lera 

Kind regards, 
=font face="Helvetica"> 
=font size="3"> 
Lera Loeb=/div> 
antoineverglas.com chttp://antoineverglas.com> 
=1span> 
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NEW YORK= NY 10012 

MOBI=E 
PHONE: 
FAX 

at 9 E 71st, NYC. Should we 
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FOLLOW ANTOINE VERGLASk=span> 
TUMBLR 
TWITTER 
GOSEE 

<=font> 

2 

EFTA_R1_01549639 

EFTA02450655


