From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Friday, September 16, 2016 7:08 PM
To:

Subject: Re: billing - AV shooting

Yes

It's about Antoine’s shooti=g

Should | show it to Rich?

--------—-= Forwarded message ----------
From: Lera Loeb

Date: Friday, September 16,=2016
Subject: billing - AV shooting

-

| hope you're great.

Please let me know=how you'd like me to invoice you for the shooting.

I h=ve an old invoice from August 2012 for a few portraits by AV billed tn_at- MNYC,
Should we do it the same way as before?4§=A0

Thank you

Best,

Lera

Kind regards,=/span=
=/span=
<f=pan>

=span style="font-size:12px">
Lera Loeb
antoineve=glas.com <http://antoineverglas.com>

<=div>
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thereof,

=span style="font-size:12px">

130 WEST 2RD 5T=5TE 4N

NEW YORK, NY 10012<=font>

PHOME :

FAX : 212 334 0135

FOLLOW ANTOINE VERGLAS!

=span style="font-size:9px">TUMBLR <http://antoineverglas.tumbir.com/>
TWITTER <https://twitter.com/antoineverglas>

GOSEE <http://goseemag.com/>

=C24p please note

The information contained in this communic=tion is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies

including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved
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