From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Tuesday, May 1, 2018 1:34 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: brian bates

not sure how happy you were with brian bates work however he =as already exceeded 25 days brice projected for GSJ
tiki house and =eawater shed..
i reached out to jay this =m to review his findings during walk thur of islands and next =teps..

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:
Subject: =/b>Re: =SJE_BB_1099_043018

Date: =/b>April 30, 2018 at 8:05:49 PM =DT

not sure on 1099 =owever regardless he is responsible for picking up income

i noticed he has billed 8100 =hich is 27 days vs projected total of 25 or 7,500 total labor for both =rojects
can you please update me status of his =rojects
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK =ssociates Inc.
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On Apr 30, 2018, at 8:01 PM, LS) GSI _ wrote:

Good =vening Rich

Brian asked would he be getting a 1099 for =is work on L5J and GSI?
Please advise

Thank =ou
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