
From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 

Tomorw 

jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Wednesday, August 24, 2016 8:53 PM 
Richard Kahn 
Re: anna 

On Wednesday, August 24, 2016, Richard Kahn > wrote: 

i spoke wit= anna for about 25-30 mins and then we got disconnected she was breaki=g down and crying.. 
she feels that she is letting you down and d=es not know what to do.. 
she loves you and deep down believes th=t you want brice and karen to come back to LSJ unfortunately i b=lieve she is 
tired, burnt out and should be replaced (which i believe she =ould be ok with) 

most of her answers to me regard=ng things not getting done were a result of lack of follow thru on her par= and when 
she delegates work nothing gets done she said danny cl=ims he did not order part for master shower as he could not 
find it online=/div> 

below is anna credit card and when bella question= her on vendor she ordered part from last thursday 8/19 she says she 
has n= clue of that vendor in ordering parts she also agreed to 940 fe= ex charge.. 

08/19=2016 
XXXX-XXXXXX-33074 
08/19=2016 
XXXX-XXXXXX-33074 

CLICK SHOP AND RUN INC 650000004531417 - CORAL SPRINGS, FL Ann M Rodriquez 
940.00 

CLICK SHOP AND RUN INC 650000004531417 - CORAL SPRINGS, FL Ann M Rodriquez 
4,620.00 

anna and i only re=iewed 3-4 of items on your list shall i call her back and =ontinue now or resume tomorrow please 
advise thank you=/div> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv style="margin-top:0px;margin-right:0px;margin-bottom:0px;margin-left:=px'>From: 
bellaklein=< <javascript:_e(%7M7D,icvmr,SIMIMillmilm.);> > 

EFTA_R1_01556148 
EFTA02454422



Subject: Fwd: A=ex charge 08/19/16 

Richa=d Kahn < <javascript:_e(%78%7D,Icvmr, ):>> 
<=span> 

$940 is shipping c=arge that Anna agreed to, according to the vendor. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

<javascript:_e(%76%7D,Icvmr,&=39 ');> Tel: 212-971-1307 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=iv st le="margin-top:Opx;margin-right:Opx;margin-bottom:Opx;margin-left:=px">From: bellaklein 

Subject: Re: Amex charge 08/19/16 
Date: August=24, 2016 at 2:43:04 PM EDT 

To:=Ann Rodriquez 
<javascript:_e(%76%7D,'=cvmr,' ');>> 

attached your activities since August 16th 

=/div> 

<=blockquote> 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies 

thereof, 
including all atta=hments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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