
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, August 10, 2016 2:28 PM 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: Restoration Hardware Quote - August 10, 2016 

Ok 

On Wednesday, August 10, 2016, Daphne Wallace <dlbwallace@gmail.com> wrote: 

Greetings Sir, 

<=iv class="gmail_quote">For your review and approval is the quote for the=C24,pair of White with privacy 
lining wall to wall Restoration Hardware c=rtains you requested: 

$2,271.00. 

This is a Custom order, with a production time of app=oximately 3. weeks. If the order is placed today, 8/10, the 
drapery is est=mated to be ready to ship by 9/1/2016. 

Anna has reviewed for accuracy,=and confirmed that everything is in order. 

Is it okay to proceed with the or=er? 

Respectfully, 

=aphne 

<https://www.restorationhardwar=.com> 
Quote Notification 

Thank You 

Quote #QH 1025565 

Thank you for requesting a quote from Restor=tion Hardware. Please save this email for your reference. 
You can access this quote online here 
chttps://www.restorationhardwar=.com/quotes/checkout/quote.jsp?token=zQjoRloffXvys5Mbm1LTv9m0GHFMabsiolk 
=R1MH> . 
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Quote Information 

Trade Client Contact 
Daphne Daphne 
JSC Interiors, LLC 
dlbwallace@gmail.com <javascript:_e(%7B%7D,icvmUdlbwallace@gma=l.com.);> 
Trade Id: 201504086717 Jennifer Ratto 

RH - CSC 
15 Koch Road, Suite K 
CSC, Ca 94925 
800.910.9836 <tel:800.910.9836> 
webcs@rh.com <javascript:_e(%7B%7D,1cvmls,'webcs@rh.=.oms);> 

Items in your Quote 

Price Quantity Total 
<https://media.restoration=ardware.com/ir/render/rhir/E45258057_F?wid=168&color=fffef3&il=um=0> Custom 
Belgian Brushed Linen Cotton 3-Fold French-Pleat Drapery 

Item #: 13890771 OWHT<Ad> 

Fabric: Belgian Brushed Linen Cotton 
Color: White 
Drapery Lining: Privacy 
Panel Pair 
Width 156" 
Length 114" 
Window Label Living Room 

Delivery Method 
Standa=d Delivery Shipping <https://www.restorationhardw=re.comicustomer-service/shipping-and-delivery-info.jsp> 
IMPORTANT: CUSTOM ORDER TERMS OF SALE 
Custom orders begin production immediately upon order and are built=to your specifications. They cannot be cancelled, 
changed, returned or ref=nded at any time. A non-refundable 50% deposit will be taken when the orde= is placed. 

$2,929.00 Original 
$2,196.00 

$2,196.00 

<https://www.restoration=ardware.com/assetstimages/blank.gif> 
Order Estimate 

Subtotal $2,196.00 
Shipping $75.00 
Total (excluding sales tax) $2,271.00 
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<https://www=restorationhardware.com/assets/images/blank.gif> =nd> 
TERMS & CO=DITIONS OF THIS QUOTE: 
This quote is not a contract for sale. All quoted prices are su=ject to change at anytime, with no prior notice, and pricing 
is considered=established at the time the quote is converted into an order. This quote d=es not include applicable sales 
tax, insurance, or similar charges. Shippi=g, handling, freight charges and rush delivery are estimates only. Sales t=x will 
be calculated at the line item level upon each individual shipment =ased on the sales tax rates of the ship to location. 
Prices are in United =tates Dollars (USD$). Products are not reserved until your quote is conver=ed into an order, 
accepted and processed by Restoration Hardware. 

Privacy Policy</=> I <https://www.restorationhardware.=om/customer-service/privacy-policy.jsp> Freq=ently Asked 
Questions (FAQs) <https://www.restorationhardware.=om/customer-service/frequently-asked-questions.jsp> Contact 
Us C=stomer Service <https:Thww.restorationhardware.com/customer-service/index.jsp> 

=C24, please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constit=te inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying =f this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and =ay be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attarhments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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