From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Wednesday, August 3, 2016 &:39 PM
To: Ann Rodriquez
Subject: Re: R/O plant quote
ok
wrote:
Hey Rich,

Here is the Quote from TSG for the part needed to get the R/O P=ant back up and running $3,249.34?

Please a=vise,
Ann R.

Begin forwarded mess=ge:

From: kelli Gatt [

Date: August 3, 2016 at 1:19:16 PM AST
To:=ann rodriguez
Cc: Bob Petersen =>, Rich Murrill

Subject: Quote 50.2016.013 VFD<=r>

Anna — Good afternoon to you. =/p=

| have attached a quote for repairs to your water pl=nt.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thank you,
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Kelli Gatti<=pan style="font-family:"Arial",sans-serif;color:#003366"></=>
Retail Procurement Specialist=u>
TSG Water Resources, Inc.<=u>

2401-B NE 18th Terrace=u>

Gainesville FL 32609

www.tsgwater.com <http://www.tsgwater.com= target=>

<=blockquote=

=djv=

p=ease note

The information contained in this communication is
co=fidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside inf=rmation, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the p=operty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
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com=unication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawfu=. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us im=ediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto;jeevacation=gmail.com=, and
destroy thi= communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments, copyr=ght -all rights reserved
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