
From: David Mitchell 
Sent: Friday, April 27, 2018 9:08 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Not sure Hanson was intentional cc 

Trying to work out something with his Chef for the restaurant sending =ou Howie email 

Statues being photographed and being displayed at fair , asking $750,0=0 ( will take $500,00) 

Need to photograph Hercules for Abu Dhabi and others asking $1,250,000=/div> 

Open house in Sagaponack , 
3 showings already scheduled in addition 

320 has final inspection Tuesday for last sign off for TCO Have first open house Sunday with new brokers 

hotel needs Engineer , architect and Structural engineer to confirm co=struction done according to drawings since they 
can't open the wall in 7=places , all have confirmed they will early next week then inspection will=be signed off by the 
third party engineer and then TCO 

For Southampton May 1 we can call for Time of the Essence closing whic= latest will be May 21 We are calling it for the 
10th Buyer has agreed to this 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
745 Fifth Avenue 
New York NY 10151 
USA 

1=> <mailto:ca 

On Apr 27, 2018, at 3:49 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com> wrote: 

status? 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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