
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 25, 2016 11:19 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: marty 

send to marty, can you confirm these amo=nts before i send to jeffrey 

On Mon, Jul 25, 2016 at 2:51 PM, Richard Kahn «mailto > wrote: 

1/31/15 62,500.00 1/31/16 9,425.00 
2/28/15 25,412.50 2/29/16 26,891.00 
3/31/15 15,325.00 3/31/16 9,337.50 
4/30/15 30,125.50 4/30/16 27,000.00 UNPAID 
5/31/15 29,162.00 5/31/16 32,750.00 
6/30/15 17,308.00 6/30/16 5,124.56 UNPAID 
7/31/15 18,166.00 total 110,528.06 
8/31/15 7,666.00 
9/30/15 21,400.00 
10/31/15 41,617.00 
11/30/15 35,733.00 
12/31/15 15,450.00 
total 319,865.00 

<=iv class="gmail_signature" data-smartmail="gmail_signature"> 
please note 

The=information contained in this communication is confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is inten=ed only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE U=authorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
receive= this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and al= copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reser=ed 
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