
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 22, 2016 12:38 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Pokey: LS1 Thatching 

how long will it take? 

On Fri, Jul 22, 2016 at 8:37 AM, Ann Rodriq=ez < <mailto: » wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey is asking for $3,500.00 to do the thatching on t.5.1? 

Need thatching: 
Main Shed 
New Beach 
St. John Lookout 
Tiki hut 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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