
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2016 5:35 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: Class GIV 

Ok 

On Tuesday, 19 July 2016, Larry Visoski < wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Sumflite has a class for Nadia for Recurrent and ATP (Airline Transport Rat=ng) check ride,. She'll get 12 hours of 

sim time, 

Should would start next Monday and check ride Saturday July 30th. 
Price is $17,500 for recurrent and ATP check. 
Is this approved to pay? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =1 this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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