
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 1, 2016 1:31 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Gratitude Audit 

yes 

immommonien
On Fri, Jul 1, 2016 at 9:08 AM, Richard Kahn < » wrote:

attached are confirms that accounting firm need= to send out to verify bank balances, donation and no 
outstanding litigati=n 

page 7 for for leon's office 
please advise if ok t=at it is sent to brad 
thank you 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: David Hasson <=a href=" 

Subject: =/span>Confi rms 

Date: July 1, 2016 at 9:01:56 AM EDT 
<Moan> 
To: =ichard Kahn <r 

Here you go Rich, 

Thanks</=iv> 

David M. Hasson CPA, PFS<=> 
Seckendorf Hasson & Reilly CPA's, LLC<=> 
3000 Marcus Avenue, Suite 3w4 
Lake Success NY 11042 

=div style="margin:0in Din 0.0001ptIont-size:11ptfont-family:Calibri,sa=s-serif"> 
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=C24> please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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