
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2016 8:48 PM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: ZDC Microwave Project Update 

?? 

 Forwarded mess=ge 
From: Brice Gordon c=1 
Date: Mon, Jul 11, 2016 at 1:58 PM 
Subject: Re: ZDC Mi=rowave Project Update 
To: "jeffrey E." «mailto:zdc.rt41@gmail.com> jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com» 
Cc: Rich Kahn «= href= 

Je=frey 

Advised Future Tech of your concerns regarding down time of p=one service during install of new Microwave link. 

The best they can do i= 

Slide the existing T1 link down the tower on Sandia Crest a=d Ranch, reestablish service this will take two days and 
4=men, cost $6800.00, /down time 2 days </=>instead of 5 days once new lin= is installed, decommission old T1 link, 
down time 2-4 hrs. 

jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

ok for sierra, but cannot have p=one disruption 

On Fri, Jul 8, 2016 at 2:33 PM, Brice Gordon > wrote: 

Main House. 

Jeffrey 

Future Tech are scheduled=to be on sight July 31st for the install of Microwave Link from Sandia Cre=t to 

Install of Link is ex=ected to take 5 to 7 days 

There have some changes to the initial design.=/div> 
Due to engineering and tower owner con=erns, the existing T1 link will be decommissioned, 
New Antennas will be installed in place of existing.</=iv> 
T1 Phone service and Data services will =se new link, 
Please note during =his time Phone Services to the Ranch will be disrupted. 
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Centuryli=k 
There is an issue with the Fiber Ins=all on Sandia Crest. 
The initial insta=l entailed laying 6-8 ft of conduit from Centurylink Demark to an Existing=Conduit 

owned by tower owner, Sierra Nevada Towers. 
The Tower owner has indicated the existing conduit has been b=dly damaged and there will be a need to 

lay a new run of conduit from Dmar= to his building. (40' rigid buried and 140' above ground galvaniz=d conduit.), Sierra 
Nevada have indicated a Estimated Cost of $4500.00, wi=h 

work been completed by Thursday next=week 

I did initial indicate to Rich, we could perform this work for $350=.00, but after reviewing scope of work 
with Future Tech, I would advise Si=rra Nevada perform this work. 

Centuryl=nk have indicated this could possibly delay install of Circuit 

Do I have=your approval to move forward with Sierra Nevada 

Regards Brice 

<=iv style="font-size:small"> 

=/div> 

Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this commu=ication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addre=see. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copyi=g of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
a=d may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all a=tachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

=div dir="Itr"> 
Brice Gordon 
Stanl=y, NM 

9> 

Bric= Gordon 
Stanley, NM 

=AO please note 

The information contained in this commu=ication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
cons=itute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addre=see. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copyi=g of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
a=d may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all a=tachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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