
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 30, 2016 3:30 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Funding for Temporary Contractors 

Ok 

On Thursday, 30 June 2016, Ann Rodriquez <annrodriquez@yahoo.com> wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

I would like to request Funding for the Temporary Contractors for this week=(6/27-7/1) $3,000.00 and next 
week (7/4-7/8) $3,000.00. 

Requesting amount for 2 weeks $6,000.00? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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