
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, July 8, 2016 8:16 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Pokey: Platform and Master bedroom floor 

ok 

On Fri, Jul 8, 2016 at 4:04 PM, Ann Rodriquez annrodriqu=z@yahoo.com <mailto:  > wrote: 

Should I tell him $1,000.00 for the platform? 

On Jul 8, 2016, at 2:34 PM, jeffrey E. c wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey is requesting $1,500.00 for GSJ 12x12 Platform and $1,500.00 for LSJ =aster BR floor? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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