
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 14, 2016 10:04 PM 
To: Larry Visoski 
Subject: Re: 8727 update 

Ok 

On Tuesday, 14 June 2016, Larry Visoski <-> wrote: 

Jeffrey 
Gary is working a buyer at $1.4M„ that price will be lower, since that pri=e was discussed before the engine 

issues were uncovered. 
The buy is contacting Manny at FJTurbines to confirm his repair quote„ and=also speaking to Scott Stambaugh 

regarding the heavy C check quote., 

I told Mark Williams to stand down approaching Manny at FJTurbine to confro=t him with regards to our 
corroded HPC discs„ 

I dont want to burn our bridge at FJTurbines just yet with our investigatio=. 
Since it's a good chance IF we locate a buyer soon, we'll need FJTu=bine to repair the engines per their quote. 

Do you approve of his approach? 

Thank you 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

=C2 please note 

The information contained in this communic=tion is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constit=te 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addresse=. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying =f this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and =ay be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, pleas= notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com, and<=r>destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all atta=hments. copyright 
-all rights reserved 
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