
From: Eric Roth 
Sent: Wednesday, April 25, 2018 3:21 PM 
To: Jeffrey E.; Richard Kahn 
Subject: RE: 

Payment received. Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Eric 

ERIC H. ROTH I PRESIDENT 

I www.intljet.com 
chttp://www.intljet.comh <http://twitter.com/Wintljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet> 

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Wednesday, April 25, 2018 10:42 AM 
To: Richard Kahn ; Eric Roth 
Subject: 

pleae send eric 100k today thx 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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