From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Friday, June 10, 2016 1:32 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Flagpole

facts not 100% accurate as vendor notified us of delay 1 day =fter funds were wired should we request money back and
=ind another vendor, wait or pursue choices other than =iberglass please advise thank =ou

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Jun 10, 2016, at 9:30 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

---------- =orwarded message ----------

From: Ann Rodriquez

Date: =ri, Jun 10, 2016 at 9:29 AM
Subject: Fwd: Flagpole
To: Jeffrey <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >

Hey =ossman,

Would you like to purchase the Aluminum Flagpole or should we =ait the 8-12weeks for the Fiberglass Flagpole?
We have 2 Fiberglass =lagpoles on L5/,

Please advise,

Ann R.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace NN
Date: June 9, 2016 at 4:39:15 PM AST

To: Rich Kahn —. 21 n rodrique: [

1
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Subject: Fwd: Flagpole

Greetings Anna,
There is a problem with the timeline =or the receipt of the flagpole - now B-12 weeks versus 4-5 =eeks.
Do you =ant to review this with JE? The company has suggested an =Iternative. The details are below.

Let me know.

--=-=----- Forwarded message ----------

From: Holly Grace <

Date: Thu, Jun 9, 2016 at 3:35 PM

Subject: =lagpole

To: I
Cc: Mike Lawrence :I_

Hello Daphne. We received =he wire transfer today in the amount of $15,750.00. Thank you for =he
prompt payment.

When we received the manufacturer's quote on 5/31, =hey quoted us a 4-5 week lead time which we
passed along to you. =pon receipt of the wire transfer today, | contacted the pole =anufacturer to get the order into
production. They have changed their lead time to 8-12 weeks based on orders they currently =ave in house. | have
asked for expedited production but they =an't promise me anything.

With this being said, | would like to offer you a =hite powder coated aluminum pole that can be
delivered to the freight =orwarder in about 3 weeks. We will discount the pole by $500.00 =o a price of $12,855.00.
Freight would remain the same,

Please =et me know your thoughts ASAP. | have placed the order on hold =ith the fiberglass
manufacturer until | hear from you. | am very =orry for the increase in lead time, but the manufacturer produces =rders
as they are received.

Kindest regards,
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Holly D. Grace

The Flag =ompany, Inc.

please =ote

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return @-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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