From: bellaklein <[ G

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 1:44 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Re:

Jeffrey,

Yesterday charges are same, the =tatus changed from pending to posted. Dates of the posted charges are =ame. The
double charge for 5830 that was pending did not become a =osted charge, one charge probably was declined by Amex

and charged =gain by Magnani office, but posted only once.

05/10/2016 7W51 DENTAL =ROUP - NEW YORK, NY 1,100.00 -
05/09/2016 7W51 DENTAL =ROUP - NEW YORK, NY 605.00 [
05/09/2016 7W51 DENTAL =ROUP - NEW YORK, NY 800.00 JE
05/09/2016 7W51 DENTAL =ROUP - NEW YORK, NY 830.00 -

Thank you,
Bella

Tel:

On May 17, 2016, at 5:23 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

Why 2400 dollars =esterday dentist charge

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee, It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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