From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com >

Sent: Monday, April 23, 2018 $:09 PM
To: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: L5J: Chris request

no fighting for 1300

wrote:

ok

i th=nk this is chris speaking with danny and hearing about his potential payou= and carlos and thinking he got
nothing...even though he quit..

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington
<https://maps.google=com/?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gma=|&source=g>
Avenue 4th Floor
<https://maps.google.co=/7?q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+ 1002 2&entry=gmail&=mp;source=g>

MNew York, NY
<https://maps.google.com/=q=575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+Ny+10022 &entry=gmail &am=;source=g>
10022
<https: 20=3D575+Lexington+Avenue+dth+Floor+New+York,+NY+10022&entry=gmail&=ource=g»

On Apr 23, 2018, at 4:56 PM, jeffre= E. <jeevaca=ion@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com=> =
wrote:

---------- Forwarded message -=-=-=----

From: ann rodrique: (N - - Mo
Apr 23, 2018 at 4:52 PM

Subject: LSJ: Chris request

EFTA_R1_01569573
EFTA02462826



To:=jeevacation@gmas=l.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com:=

=div style="font-family:Helvetica Neue,Helvetica,Arial sans-serif;font-si=e:13px">
Hey Bossman,

Chris is requesting an additional: $1,375.00 (=at & Sun, Dog walker for 9 days)

Chris received an advance payment today in th= amount of 52,450.00 for days working on LS)
(weekends not included). Chri= was paid $250 a day before his retirement and now he's requesting $35= a day plus 575
a day for a dog walker ($425.00 a day).

Chris was P=id today: 52,450.00
Chris is requesting an additiona=: 51,375.00
Total payout for Chris visit: $3,825.00<=div>

=lease advise,
Ann R.

=brs--
=A0 please note

The infarmation contained in this communicati=n is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute=inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. =t is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of =his
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may=be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com>, and
=estroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachm=nts. copyright -all rights reserved
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=lease note

The information contained in this communication is c=nfidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside in=ormation, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this co=munication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawf=I. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us i=mediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacatio=@gmail.com> , and destroy th=s communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copy=ight -all rights reserved
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