From: Richard Kahn <[ -

Sent: Thursday, May 12, 2016 7:34 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: G5 Bond

had orders in all day at 74.25 and nothing done been speaking with MS ML and DB and just found out that MS =wns
2mm quantity in house and offered them at 74.375 Andrew at M5 believes we will get done on 2mm quantity at =4.30
total cost (before accrued interest) of 1,486,000 if so shall please advise 74.3 ok and shall we book in =ratitude or 5TC
thank you

Gratitude has 4,700,000 cash at MS and =TC has 250,000

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor

On May 12, 2016, at 7:44 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

remind me next week , lets try to buy the bonds at =4.25 can buy in pieces

On Thu, =ay 12, 2016 at 2:47 AM, Richard Kahn -=:_:~ wrote:

Please advise how | =hall respond
Thank you

on 5/11/16, 8:21 PM, [ - ote:

=>Hi Rich. | really need to apply for health insurance and i don't =now if
=ill qualify with everything now. And i cant afford to buy my own.. =an
=you let me know what i should do?

-1

=5ent from my iPhone
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please =ote

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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