
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Saturday, May 7, 2016 9:18 AM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Beach Bar & Cistern 

air in bedroom not fixed.? 

On Fri, May 6, 2016 at 7:49 PM, Ann Rod=iquez 
wrote: 

Ok 

Ann R. 

On =ay 6, 2016, at 7:27 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail=com> wrote: 

<=lockquote type="cite"> 
no, 1000 per ,=C21, he knows he gets paid only at the end, but we will be geinerou= 

On Fri= May 6, 2016 at 7:20 PM, Ann Rodriquez <annrodriquez@yahoo.com&g=; wrote: 

H=y Bossman, 

Pokey just called about payment for hi= helpers... 

=font color="#000000">He's requesting... 
$2,000.00 a week for 5 w=eks starting Friday and then a final payment of $10,000.00 once 

everything=is a 100% completed. 

=div> 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

Begin forwardethmessage: 

iiFrom: Ann Rodr=quez <a 
Date: May 4, 2016 at 4:3 i 
=b>To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m» 
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Subject: R=: Pokey: Bid for Beach Bar & Cistern 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey along with 2 helpers will be working on the Beach Bar & Cistern=project. Pokey said the project 
will be completed in 5 weeks. 

<=iv> 

He's requesting... 
$2,000.00 a week for 5 =eeks starting Friday ($10,000.00) then a final payment of $10,000.00 once 

=verything is a 100% completed. 

Please advis=, 
Ann R. 

On A r 25 2016 at 12:06 PM, Ann R=driquez 
<n) > wrote: 

=div> 
He agreed to do the Cistern and Bar for the 20k. 

Ann=R. 

On Apr 25, 2016, at 11:43 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>= wrote: 

20k f=r both 

w=n Mon, Apr 25, 2016 at 11:33 AM, Ann Rodriquez < rote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Pokey is bidding $3,500.00 for the Beach Bar (including worker) and $22,000=00 
for the Cistern (including workers)? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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=C* please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
, and 

destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 

=C* please note 

The information containe= in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the u=e of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disc=osure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly =rohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail =o jeevacation@g=ail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
=ncluding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

</=iv> 

=C* please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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