
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, April 25, 2016 4:49 PM 
To: Ann Rodriquez 
Subject: Re: Pokey: Dock expansion 

separate 

On Mon, Apr 25, 2016 at 12:05 PM, Ann Rodriquez < 
wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Would you li=e us to pay Pokey $6,000.00 and have him pay his worker the $720.00 out of=his payment or 
should I pay them separately? 

Please advise, =br>Ann R. 

Pokey $6,000.00 
Total payment i= all $10,000.00 

Mr. Oscal $720.00 
Total payment in=all $4,200.00 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Date: April 25, 2016 at 11:53:31 AM AST 
To: =nn rodriquez < 
Cc: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: Re: Pokey: c expansio 

please confirm jee is paying pokey 1=k and all of helpers invoices totaling 4200 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 

> > 
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<mailt 
On Apr 25, 2016, at 11:46 AM, Ann R=driquez 

> wrote: 

An= R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<mailto: > 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:je=vacation@gmail.com» 
=ate: April 25, 2016 at 11:43:00 AM AST 
To: Ann Rodriquez < 

Subject: Re: Pokey: Dock expansion 

pay the=6000 

On=Mon, Apr 25, 2016 at 11:39 AM, Ann Rodriquez 
,t a» wrote: 

=div>Hey Bossman, 

=/div> 
Just a remi=der... 

Pokey just asked me about his final payment for the Dock expansion? 

$6,000.00 

We've paid his helper so far=$3,480.00 not including $720.00 for this week. 
Total amount paid to helper=would be $4,200.00 

Please advise,=C2* 
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Ann R. 

o 
On Apr 22, 2016, at 12:01 PM, Ann Rodrique= < 

<mailt > wrote: 

Yes. 

$4,000.=0 paid to Pokey for Dock roof expansion 

$1,=00.00 paid to Pokey for Jet Ski dock expansion 

<=iv>We've paid his helper so far $3,480.00 not including $720.00 for th=s 
week. Total amount paid to helper would be $4,200.00 

<=iv>Ann R. 

On Apr 22, 2016, at 11:51 AM, Jeffrey E. <=jeevacation@gma=l.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

all the thatch? how much has he received to date? 
<=div> 

On Fri, Apr =2, 2016 at 11:50 AM, Ann Rodriquez 
>4=pan> wrote: 

Hi Bossman, 

Pokey said the Dock expansion will be completed tomorrow morning 4/23. 
He&#=9;s requesting the balance owed to him in the amount of $6,000.00 (Final p=yment)? 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

=C240 please note 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only =or 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthoriz=d use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof =s strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

return e-mail o= by e-mail to j=evacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 

destroy this communication and all copies =hereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
</=iv> 

=C24k please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If 

you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Q=A0 please note 

The information contained in this communication is<=r>confidential, may be 
attorney-client privileged, may 

constitute insid= information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is =he property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of thiscommunication or any part 

thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be un=awful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify =s immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevac=tion@gmail.com> , and 
destro= this communication and all copies thereof, 
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including all attachments. =opyright -all rights reserved 
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