From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 25, 2016 4:50 PM

To: Larry Visoski

Subject: Re: GIV Mx approval

yes

On Mon, Apr 25, 2016 at 12:06 PM, Larry Visoski _ wrote:
Jeffrey,

May | have your approval to wire Meridean for this invoice? $51,163.14

Pete was able to locate better pricing for pressurization transducer repair=when GIV was in Westfield Mx,.
Gulfstream quoted S89k then reduced their p=ice to 549k for the Transducer, Pete located this part for 524,750 for
us.=br> Other high dollar item was Wifi router box $18,553.60 (this item will be ch=nged today with warrenty). Since
Wifi failed on today's flight.

Remaining Balance was Petes monthly labor,.

Is this approved for Wire Trafr?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPad

=AD please note

The information contained in this commus=ication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may cons=itute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addre=see. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copyi=g of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited a=d may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, pl=ase notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d destroy this communication and all copies thereof, including all astachments. copyright -all
rights reserved
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