
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Monday, April , 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: LSJ: Chris request 

ok 

i think this =s chris speaking with danny and hearing about his potential payout and =arlos and thinking he got 
nothing...even though he =uit.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Apr 23, 2018, at 4:56 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

pay 

 Forwarded messy e 
From: ann rodriquez > > 
Date: =on, Apr 23, 2018 at 4:52 PM 
Subject: LSJ: Chris =equest 
To: jeevacation mail.com <mailto:'eev cation@gmail.com> 
Cc: Rich Kahn 

Hey Bossman, 

Chris is requesting an additional: =1,375.00 (Sat & Sun, Dog walker for 9 days) 

Chris received an advance payment today in the =mount of $2,450.00 for days working on LSJ (weekends not 
included). =hris was paid $250 a day before his retirement and now he's requesting =350 a day plus $75 a day for a dog 
walker ($425.00 a =ay). 
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Chris was Paid today: $2,450.00 
Chris is requesting an additional: $1,375.00 
Total payout for Chris visit: $3,825.00 

Chris =ell (340) 513-9010 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

please note 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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