From: Richard Kahn —

Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 3:08 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: Lutron final photos please

attached are photos of plates al installed last week al has asked for payment of his balance due of 25,000 for =riginal
scope of work

merwin just informed me from your email dated january 25th =hat you also would like switches to be brass in powder
rooms (original =witches were plastic)

al also would like to meet with you to review options for New =exico

please advise if ok to pay and if you are available this week =o review New Mexico thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

Subject: =/b>Re: Lutron final =hotos please

Date: March 11, 2016 at 8:04:21 AM EST

Hi Rich,
Here are some =ictures.

Outside massage room. They will come back for this to replace =he plate. It's a little scratched up.

Her dressing room.
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His dressing room.
Massage room entrance.

Merwin =ela Cruz

On Mar 10, 2016, at 6:04 PM, Richard kahn || RN

Sent from my iPhone
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