
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, April 17, 2018 8:24 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Black card info 

please confirm that Black card will pay Soho house fees and =11 expenses but required checking account just as backup 
will be account thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

On Apr 17, 2018, at 4:11 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

set up one in her name. 

On Tue, =pr 17, 2018 at 4:09 PM, Richard Kahn rote: 

i have been speaking with regarding soho house 
regarding online =ayment setup they will charge her black amex for fees 

it appears (and i am =aiting on verification) that they require a checking account as well =or 
overcharges..(as opposed to black amex) 

should = use your personal account at DB, another entity, or 

have.  

put in =er checking account for 

please =dvise 
these charges.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue 4th =Ioor 
New York, =Y 10022 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From:

Subject: =/b>Black card =nfo 

Date: =/b>April 17, 2018 at 10:35:48 AM =DT 

To: qb>Ftichard Kahn 

Hi =ichard, 

I =eed to fill out this information for my Soho House membership fee. I =poke with Jeffrey, and 
he said he would like me to use the black card =o pay. Any chance you could give me this info? Thank you so =uch! 

&l=;Screen Shot 2018-04-17 at 10.19.41 =M.png> 

please =ote 

The information contained in this =ommunication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this 
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof, 
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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