
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, March 15, 2016 1:39 AM 
To: Kathy Ruemmler 
Subject: Re: 

its not , it would be rothschild baer ,=C24> it would keep the name and ariane. , sale is a tax=event , this is a liquidity 
event. . 

On Mon, Mar 14, 2016 at 7:=1 PM, Kathy Ruemmler < > 
wrote:=br> 

Got it. Cyn=hia says no outright sale. One of the things I need to talk to arian= about. 

Sent from my iPad 

On Mar 14, 2016, at =:36 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

sale price. interests are=aligned. approx sale 2- 2.5 b, I will not appear in the =irect negotiations
google handicap ). either you=C24> someone else at your firm , or another one of my deal guys, will be =he face, . I will 
step in if needed, but i dont forsee that . =C24, 

On Mon Mar 14 2016 at 7:32 PM, Kathy Ruemmler 
<mail > wrote: 

jeevacation@gmail.com&=t; wrote: 

re =eal, simple, they pay all third party expenses.Q=A0 they can cap them, legal 
etc. I get=nothing unless the deal closes. the fee is 5 %- the exp=nses. , so fails they pay expenses only, success 
l=reimburse all expenses and southern trust gets fee. 

On Mon, Mar 14, 2016 at =:51 PM, Kathy Ruemmler 
> wrot=: 

Just got off th= phone with her. 202-669-7405 <tel:202-669-7405> 

Sent from my iPhone 
On Mar 14, 2016, at 6:24 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation=gmail.com» wrote: 
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<=div> 

Cynthia? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may b= attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE=br>Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any=part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have re=eived this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
r=turn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication a=d all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights =eserved 

please n=te 

The information contained in this communication is 
confident=al, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informatio=, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property=of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communicat=on or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If y=u have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediate=y by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.=om> , and 
destroy this commu=ication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -a=l rights reserved 

please n=te 

The information contained in this communication is 
confident=al, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside informatio=, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property=of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communicat=on or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If y=u have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediate=y by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.=om> 

and 
destroy this commu=ication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -a=l rights reserved 

=C2j, please note 

The information contained in this co=munication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
c=nstitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the ad=ressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or co=ying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibitedand may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error,=please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com</=>, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including =11 attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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